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 January 27, 2021
 Wednesday
08:00 - 17:00 Defensive Tactics and ASP Training -- TEEX Wiatt Bldg. Classroom

Officers will be given instruction on the use of Defense Tactics in order to 
respond and protect themselves, and/or others, to the most common forms 
of resistance encountered while performing their duties. The ASP portion of 
this course it to instruct the students on the techniques for use of the 
expandable baton.
 
Class will be for 10 hours.

Instructors: Sgt. Rios, Officer Cobos, Officer Crenshaw, Officer Hickman

Class Location: Wiatt Building at the RELLIS Campus

Maximum class size: 12

Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned patrol officers.

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 February 3, 2021
 Wednesday
08:00 - 17:00 Defensive Tactics and ASP Training -- TEEX Wiatt Bldg. Classroom

Officers will be given instruction on the use of Defense Tactics in order to 
respond and protect themselves, and/or others, to the most common forms 
of resistance encountered while performing their duties. The ASP portion of 
this course it to instruct the students on the techniques for use of the 
expandable baton.
 
Class will be for 10 hours.

Instructors: Sgt. Rios, Officer Cobos, Officer Crenshaw, Officer Hickman

Class Location: Wiatt Building at the RELLIS Campus

Maximum class size: 12

Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned patrol officers.

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.
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 February 10, 2021
 Wednesday
08:00 - 17:00 Defensive Tactics and ASP Training -- TEEX Wiatt Bldg. Classroom

Officers will be given instruction on the use of Defense Tactics in order to 
respond and protect themselves, and/or others, to the most common forms 
of resistance encountered while performing their duties. The ASP portion of 
this course it to instruct the students on the techniques for use of the 
expandable baton.
 
Class will be for 8 hours.

Instructors: Lt. Rios, Officer Cobos, Officer Crenshaw, Officer Hickman

Class Location: Wiatt Building at the RELLIS Campus

Maximum class size: 12

Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned patrol officers.

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 February 22, 2021
 Monday
08:00 - 17:00 Defensive Tactics and ASP Training -- TEEX Wiatt Bldg. Classroom

Officers will be given instruction on the use of Defense Tactics in order to 
respond and protect themselves, and/or others, to the most common forms 
of resistance encountered while performing their duties. The ASP portion of 
this course it to instruct the students on the techniques for use of the 
expandable baton.
 
Class will be for 8 hours.

Instructors: Lt. Rios, Officer Cobos, Officer Crenshaw, Officer Hickman

Class Location: Wiatt Building at the RELLIS Campus

Maximum class size: 12

Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned patrol officers.

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 3, 2021
 Wednesday
08:00 - 17:00 Defensive Tactics and ASP Training -- TEEX Wiatt Bldg. Classroom

Officers will be given instruction on the use of Defense Tactics in order to 
respond and protect themselves, and/or others, to the most common forms 
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 March 3, 2021 Continued
 Wednesday

of resistance encountered while performing their duties. The ASP portion of 
this course it to instruct the students on the techniques for use of the 
expandable baton.
 
Class will be for 8 hours.

Instructors: Lt. Rios, Officer Cobos, Officer Crenshaw, Officer Hickman

Class Location: Wiatt Building at the RELLIS Campus

Maximum class size: 12

Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned patrol officers.

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 10, 2021
 Wednesday
08:00 - 17:00 Defensive Tactics and ASP Training -- TEEX Wiatt Bldg. Classroom

Officers will be given instruction on the use of Defense Tactics in order to 
respond and protect themselves, and/or others, to the most common forms 
of resistance encountered while performing their duties. The ASP portion of 
this course it to instruct the students on the techniques for use of the 
expandable baton.
 
Class will be for 8 hours.

Instructors: Lt. Rios, Officer Cobos, Officer Crenshaw, Officer Hickman

Class Location: Wiatt Building at the RELLIS Campus

Maximum class size: 12

Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned patrol officers.

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 15, 2021
 Monday
08:00 - 17:00 Defensive Tactics and ASP Training -- TEEX Wiatt Bldg. Classroom

Officers will be given instruction on the use of Defense Tactics in order to 
respond and protect themselves, and/or others, to the most common forms 
of resistance encountered while performing their duties. The ASP portion of 
this course it to instruct the students on the techniques for use of the 
expandable baton.
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 March 15, 2021 Continued
 Monday

 
Class will be for 8 hours.

Instructors: Lt. Rios, Officer Cobos, Officer Crenshaw, Officer Hickman

Class Location: Wiatt Building at the RELLIS Campus

Maximum class size: 12

Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned patrol officers.

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 17, 2021
 Wednesday
08:00 - 17:00 Defensive Tactics and ASP Training -- TEEX Wiatt Bldg. Classroom

Officers will be given instruction on the use of Defense Tactics in order to 
respond and protect themselves, and/or others, to the most common forms 
of resistance encountered while performing their duties. The ASP portion of 
this course it to instruct the students on the techniques for use of the 
expandable baton.
 
Class will be for 8 hours.

Instructors: Lt. Rios, Officer Cobos, Officer Crenshaw, Officer Hickman

Class Location: Wiatt Building at the RELLIS Campus

Maximum class size: 12

Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned patrol officers.

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 22, 2021
 Monday
07:00 - 17:00 Annual Firearms Qualifications -- TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus

Annual Qualifications as required by TCOLE.  This is not training.  It is a 
test to see that officers are proficient in the use of their weapons.
 
Qualifications times will be for 3 hours.
 
Instructors:  Officer Jackson, Sgt. Goldwater, Det. Rogers, Sgt. 
Huddleston, Sgt. Wallingford
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 March 22, 2021 Continued
 Monday

Maximum Class size:  One-fifth of the commissioned personnel
 
Class Location:  TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus
 
Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned police officers.
 
The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 23, 2021
 Tuesday
07:00 - 17:00 Annual Firearms Qualifications -- TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus

Annual Qualifications as required by TCOLE.  This is not training.  It is a 
test to see that officers are proficient in the use of their weapons.
 
Qualifications times will be for 3 hours.
 
Instructors:  Officer Jackson, Sgt. Goldwater, Det. Rogers, Sgt. 
Huddleston, Sgt. Wallingford
 
Maximum Class size:  One-fifth of the commissioned personnel
 
Class Location:  TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus
 
Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned police officers.
 
The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 24, 2021
 Wednesday
07:00 - 17:00 Annual Firearms Qualifications -- TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus

Annual Qualifications as required by TCOLE.  This is not training.  It is a 
test to see that officers are proficient in the use of their weapons.
 
Qualifications times will be for 3 hours.
 
Instructors:  Officer Jackson, Sgt. Goldwater, Det. Rogers, Sgt. 
Huddleston, Sgt. Wallingford
 
Maximum Class size:  One-fifth of the commissioned personnel
 
Class Location:  TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus
 
Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned police officers.
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 March 24, 2021 Continued
 Wednesday

The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 29, 2021
 Monday
07:00 - 17:00 Annual Firearms Qualifications -- TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus

Annual Qualifications as required by TCOLE.  This is not training.  It is a 
test to see that officers are proficient in the use of their weapons.
 
Qualifications times will be for 3 hours.
 
Instructors:  Officer Jackson, Sgt. Goldwater, Det. Rogers, Sgt. 
Huddleston, Sgt. Wallingford
 
Maximum Class size:  One-fifth of the commissioned personnel
 
Class Location:  TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus
 
Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned police officers.
 
The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.

 March 30, 2021
 Tuesday
07:00 - 17:00 Annual Firearms Qualifications -- TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus

Annual Qualifications as required by TCOLE.  This is not training.  It is a 
test to see that officers are proficient in the use of their weapons.
 
Qualifications times will be for 3 hours.
 
Instructors:  Officer Jackson, Sgt. Goldwater, Det. Rogers, Sgt. 
Huddleston, Sgt. Wallingford
 
Maximum Class size:  One-fifth of the commissioned personnel
 
Class Location:  TEEX Firing Range at the RELLIS Campus
 
Attendance is limited to TAMU PD commissioned police officers.
 
The Training Coordinator reserves the right to change dates, times, or add 
classes as situations change or new needs for training develop.


